PUBLIC NOTICE

OFFICIAL NOTICE OF SPECIAL CALLED MEETING
OF THE CULLMAN COUNTY COMMISSION

The Cullman County Commission has called a Special Called Meeting for
Tuesday, August 2, 2022, at 10:00 a.m. to occur at the following location:

Cullman County Courthouse
Commission Conference Room
500 Second Avenue SW, Room 105
Cullman, Alabama 35055

The sole purpose of this meeting is to:

Resolution 2022-62: Accept the bid by Banner Industrial Construction, Inc. for the
construction of the replacement bridges as described in project 21-RT-55-01

Award Bid # 1406 for Jail Supplies

Consider the purchase of two(2) 2021 4WD Ford Explorers from Stivers Ford on State Bid
T191 for the Appraisal and Mapping Department in the amount of $30,366 each

Consider replacement of HVAC unit at County Office Buildingin the amount of $10,831.51

Request from Attorney for Executive Session under Section 7 of Act No. 2005-40

Dated this the 27th day of July, 2022.

BY:/s/ Tiffany Merriman
Tiffany Merriman

Clerk for Cullman County
500 Second Avenue, S.W.
Cullman, Alabama 35055
Telephone: (256) 775-4878




CULLMAN COUNTY COMMISSION
RESOLUTION TO ACCEPT BID OF CONSTRUCTION OF REPLACEMENT BRIDGES
RESOLUTION # 2022 -62

WHEREAS, Cullman County had applied to the State of Alabama for Recreational Trails Program (RTP)
Funds to replace bridges and rehab trails at Stony Lonesome OHV Park; and

WHEREAS, Cullman County received notice form the Alabama Department of Economic and Community
Affairs (ADECA) that the County’s project had been selected for funding as RTP project 21-RT-55-01; and

WHEREAS, ADECA requested the County to make a formal resolution accepting the offer of financial
assistance and recommitting to provide the required matching share ($275,413.38 or 43% of the total
project); and

WHEREAS, Cullman County authorized the Chairman to accept the offer of financial assistance in the
amount of $365,142.12 through the Recreational Trails Program for project 21-RT-55-01 for bridge
replacement and trial rehabilitation at the Stony Lonesome OHV Park;

WHEREAS, that Cullman County authorized the Chairman to start the bidding process for the
construction of the replacement bridges as described in project 21-RT-55-01;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Cullman County Commission accepts the bid provided by

Banner Industrial Construction, Inc. in the bid amount of $320,649 for the construction of the
replacement bridges as described in project 21-RT-55-01.

Adopted the 2nd day of August 2022.

d} he (L-m_f/

eff “Clem” Clemons, Chairman

ATTEST:

v N epoeen

iffany err@n, CA\Jth Clerk




Bid No.1406

INVITATION TO BIDDERS

The Culiman County Commission will be receiving bids until 2:00 p.m., Monday, August 1, 2022, in Room 105 of
the Cullman County Courthouse, Cullman, Alabama, for supplies for the jail. At this time sealed bids will be
publicly opened and read aloud.

Deliveries will be accepted Monday through Friday between 8:00 a.m. and 4:00 p.m. Bidder must be able to
deliver products within fourteen (14) days of order date.

Bid may be awarded whole or in part.

The Cullman County Commission reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to waive any formalities in
the bidding.

If you have any questions regarding this bid, please contact __ Susan Black _, Culiman County Sheriff's Office,
directly at 256-775-4714, or emazil _sblack@cullmansheriff.org .
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SPECIFICATIONS
SUPPLIES FOR CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL

APPROXIMATE Item Descripticn Price per | Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, Total
ect.
75 Cases Chlorine Bleach: Clorox, or equivalent, 6/ 1 gallon containers " ” : i
’ ’ ‘ ! o
per case 20k 70 \}652 =
50 Cases Clorox or equivalent wipes, 35 wet wipes per container, 12
; : 3 VA
containers per case ; /7 ALSE 337” gbiz.é |,7lc"£’“
30 Cases Fogger Disinfectant for Clorox 360 machine

3150 @on T

2,358 .¢o

12 containers

Sgal Zguard Professional Antimicrobial Multi-Surface Cleaner OR

x60 - 1gal (handheld foggers) Pm'?@ “ I'j__ 44| Di.60 | WLl. o
5 Containers | Spartan floor wax or equivalent, 5-gal containers ! ' ! —
Qlare Flove s | 60 | 545 00
S Containers | Spartan wax stripger or equivalent, 5-gal containers
Ay-TT 72.00|30.08

5 Boxes Blue SCRUBBING Pad, 20", box of 5 pads \6 /) _)8 6
5 Boxes White POLISH Pad, 20", box of 5 pads ; % \
5751875 |
5 hoxes Red BUFFING Pad, 20", box of 5 pads i
1975 899 |
5 Boxes | Black STRIPPING Pad, 20", box of 5 pads i _ f
1575 18,75
15 ea. Auto/Car Wash Buckst, 5 gal | .
.00 | 2l te
5 Cases Fabuloso Multipurpose Cleaner, Lavender, 4/1 gal |
A e : _ 5 e | 7
Betco Stecctmeviesy Yl aatien 5.40 | 1ng.00
5 Cases Hand sanitizer, 4-2L bottles/case -
Y ute (07.60 | 510.6C
75 Cases Anti-bacterial hand soap, 4-one gal. container/per case
5 Cases Dawn dish soap, case of 4-one gal. bottles o
= . \Wal 4 A
Dawn Ongunal ¥ 921445 1]:00 | 559:0C
100 Cases Maxim Mystic Orange, or equivalent Multi-Purpose Degreaser, 1
qt bottles, 12/case Z 4 20 Z, 8{9 N, 00
100 Cases Capri Original Liquid Deodorant, or equivalent odor eliminator, 1 | ]
gt bottles, 12/case ‘-{8 Y, U[; B100.06
50 Cases Green Wave QOrganic Acid Cleaner, or equivalent scap scum/hard .
water / rust cleaner, case of 12-1 gt bottles 3,60 'Z‘ 1qo.006
2 Cases Freezer Cleaner (FP), 4/1 gal ‘ T
8y.cc | 1800
20 Cases No-Rinse floor cleaner, 4gal/case (Simplicity)

|, 5126. 80




APPROXIMATE Item Description Price per Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, Total
ect.
50 Cases Urine Screen, case of 6-10 screens T
140 2uin | 114 00| B00.02
20 Cases Lysol, or equivalent aerosol disinfectant, case of 12-19 oz. cans , ks .
A 0, 14 17 .0C
4ic4 20160 | Wiz
20 Cases Diversey Glass Non-Ammoniated Glass Clean J-Fill, 2-2.5 L
';,.‘" ~ i - K H
bottles 9920 |\1p4 .00
20 Cases Diversey Stride DC Floral Concentrate, case of 2-2.5 L bottles _
A v 2 TR an
14740 3,948 00
20 Cases Diversey J-512 Concentrate, Case of 2-2.5 L bottles i
ZL.00 | WHo. 00
10 Cases Diversey Triad 111 Concentrate, case of 2-2.5 L bottles l %2 00 %20 60
| 5 Casas Scrubs in a Bucket hand cleanar towels, 6-72ct buckets/per case 76 o0 §76 00
100 ea. 9” Trigger sprayers for 320z. bottle ‘m) 0~ 0e
" {oF
100 ea. | 32 oz. spray bottles ’ Ug U’f? Al
5 ea. 2 gallon pump sorayer s ) N i
gallon pump spray 21.36 | Ipi.so
20 ea. Dustpan % 86 -7.7 00
50 ea. Utility Brush with Handle _ [
5ea Toilet Brush _ R _
| 215 10,716
| 10 ea. lastic 35 qt. large commaearcial mop bucket w/ plastic wringer — ]
* X
NO METAL [05.00 [1,050. ¢
sti eegee - : ‘
30 ea. Plastic Scrub and Dry Squeeg |6 g0 [/Huf 00
30 ea. Wood Handle, Threaded. Lacquered, 60" long ' _ \
375 | liz.50
5 Cases Broom Replacement Head, Angled Synthetic Bristle, Case of 12 ;L 5 T
. alp- 00
heads UG7.20 |330- 00
50 ea. Upright brooms, black wooden handles, corn bristle, non-angle - 5 : y e
NO METAL outside nor inside bristles (;i 10 L{QSU(,
125 Cases Mop heads, cotton 24 oz, 12-240z/case (compatible w/ nometal |. . _ | ‘60 00
1 i
handle) Ug, 720 |Le
25 ea. Mep handies, wooden — NO METAL % CI{) ZZZ 50
5 Cases 24" Dust mop heads A e ,
Eadless st Bu. e | Y23 00
10 ea. 36" Dust mop frame, clip on %6@ %600
ip- | YW
10 ea. Clip-on dust mop handle 8$ Og EJO.@O
10 Cas 36” Dust mop heads, 12/case I VO 1 0a | LY. 00
T ) Endigss Twist 17,00 | \,VTe




APPROXIMATE ltem Descr]ption Price per Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, Total
ect.
3 Cases 21" Hair nets, 1000/case )
Z4 g0 | 11a.40
/ L/ v
150 Cases Vinyl gloves, powder free, 100/box, 10/case 5{4 0 £ 180
U0 ), 1C0, 0C
15 Cases Griddle Grill Bricks, 12/case _- .
2% p0 | 397100
30 Cases Abrasive scouring pads; Brillo or equivalent, 4”x4” steel wool . ; ) »
] - 2 1
pads w/ cleaner 120) L5 %:510 {‘.JUTCL
200 Boxes Scouring scrub pads (no sponge) 6x39in. 20/box (Triple 5)150 N e
| Cases U“} ]JZZL"UL
150 Cases | Stainless Steel Scrub pads, 6/box, 12 boxes/case 2 .
| a.52 | H,UZ8.00
e 7
10 Cases Eco security Paperboard Utensils, 5m/case %! 3. 00 3 ch 00
j L0 | Iyt |
| 10 Cases | Plastic wrapped sporks, 1000/case ZL ¢ 2 - .
) 6050
- 5 T
20 Boxes Zip lock quart bags, 500/box ‘q qa gﬁtﬁlco
20 Boxes Zip lock gallon bags, 250/box ik P9 o
| 490 |ZA8.0¢
| 20 Cases Zip lock Sandwich bags #20, 6x5, 1.4 MIL, 1000/case 19 ,75 g&g 00
300 Cases Garbage bags, heavy duty white, minimum capacity of 55 gal, ' A g .
100/case | (D Hdd 5,6726.L0
25 Casss | Small garbags bags #33, 1000/case A -
a R 7i.28 | &30.00
10 Cas=s ;6‘ Styrofoam platas non-compartment, 5000/case 20 A0 | 2L 00
| 4 ‘o . / : (O
| a0 5001 Lase Q0.00 | BLO-0
| 5 Cases Styrofoam 3-Compartment carry out plates ;
2200 | jwb-cc
30 Cases 120z. Styrofoam drinking cups, 1000/case [.ﬁb 00 Z; 0Uo. 06
10 Cases 160z. Styrofoam drinking cups, 1000/case q 8
1.25 |472.50
5 cases 12 oz. Styrofoam Bowls, 8/pks per case, 125/pk : 9 ~ A
’ T i 54.00 | L70- 00
5 Cases 160z. Styrofoam squat containers, 500/case Uby 2 /}D"i‘fl 50
5 Cases Lids for 160z. squat containers, 1000/case — " ;
57.86 | 764.25
5 cases 2 oz, plastic portion clear cup, 2500/case o I 5
5 cases 2 oz, plastic portion clear cup lids, 2500/case 660‘:" 276 00
12 cases Chinet Classic White, 9 3/4x12 1/2 Pltr 9 3/4" x 12 1/2", Oval : o LCL’ 00
Platter, 500/cs “L' L0 ‘l ;
300 Cases Brown roll paper towels, 12 rolls/case ?_565 ” 050, OC




APPROXIMATE

Iltem Description

Extended

QUANTITY Total
25 Cases Paper towels, double ply, 30/case - .
100. 00
600 Cases Toilet paper, double ply, 96/case : R
pap ply, 96/ ZUJUU-UO
5 Bundles 6lb brown bags, 500/bundle O -
475
20 ea. 18" x 2000’ Food Film {110 A
Hdp.co
20 ea. 18" x 2660 Aluminum Foil For o
Sy H.D. 144.00
10 boxes 12x10.75 Aluminum Foil Sheets, 500/box Z | ZCDO

‘. Sub total

|
|
|
|
|
0
[
|
|

:
I

01,192

***NOTE: MUST INCLUDE A ‘PRICE QUOTE’ THAT INCLUDES THE PRODUCT DESCRIPTION, PRODUCT NUMBER,
UNIT OF MEASUREMENT {EACH, CASE, ETC.), QUANTITY OF ‘1’, UNIT PRICE, AND EXTENDED PRICE. ALSO

INCLUDE A CATALOG(S) FOR YOUR BUSINESS SO THAT ITEMS CAN BE CONFIRMED.

***NOTE: WE HAVE SEVERAL DIVERSEY BRAND DILUTION DISPENSERS IN THE FACILITY. IF THE VENDOR IS
UNABLE TO PROVIDE THE DIVERSEY BRAND CHEMICALS, THE VENDOR MUST PROVIDE NEW DILUTION
DISPENSERS TO US FOR THE EQUIVALENT CONCENTRATE CHEMICALS THAT ARE LISTED ABOVE AT THE TIME
OF BID APPROVAL AT THEIR COST, ****

*#*NOTE: WOOD HANDLE MUST BE ABLE TO FIT BOTH PLASTIC SCRUB/DRY SQUEEGEE AND BROOM
REPLACEMENT HEADS FOR KITCHEN USE.



| APPROXIMATE - Item Description | Price per ’ Extended

Il 20 Each - CLF Laundry Detergent, 15-gal ‘ ’
‘r | P

| ! hfc 21D
| 30 Each | SparClean All-Temp Dish Machine Dish Detergent, 5-gal | ;
I .1 ! IRy
‘i 10 Each ' SparClean All-Temp Dish Machine Rinse Aid, 5
i

| QUANTITY | | gal,case, | Total |
| | | ect. | l
| 100 Each | Spartan Blue-Glo Hand Dishwashing Detergent, 5-gal | |
| | ! | Ng B |
20 Each | CLF Color Safe Bleach, 15.gal T
J i ' J }‘i{_:- E!D :
| 20 Each JI CLF Liquid Alkali, 15 gal : 5 oo ,
T I — 1 NGB |
| 20 Each | CLF Combo Sour/Soft, 15 gal l ;
1 | | NC B\D

-gal

| | INC BiD

' 30 Each . ‘ SparClean Low-Temp Dish Machine Sanitizer, 5-gal ( . i
r f | ’ Ny BiD |
| 30 Cases | Spartan San-T-10 Plus SanitizerWﬁ
| | | No R D
Il 15 Cases | Orange Tough 40, 4/1-gal/ per case ’ ]

.

i

| ! | INC BT |
| | GRAND TOTAL i

1 - Y 4 |

“"*NOTE: MUST INCLUDE A ‘PRICE QUOTE’ THAT INCLUDES THE PRODUCT DESCRIPTION, PRODUCT NUMBER,
UNIT OF MEASUREMENT (EACH, CASE, ETC.), QUANTITY OF ‘1’, UNIT PRICE, AND EXTENDED PRICE. ALSO
INCLUDE A CATALOG(S) FOR YOUR BUSINESS 50 THAT ITEMS CAN BE CONFIRMED.

***NOTE: WE HAVE LAUNDRY DILUTION DISPENSERS IN THE FACILITY. IF THE VENDOR IS UNABLE TO
PROVIDE THE LISTED CHEMICALS, THE VENDOR MUST PROVIDE NEW DILUTION DISPENSERS TO US FOR THE
EQUIVALENT CONCENTRATE CHEMICALS THAT ARE LISTED ABOVE AT THE TIME OF BID APPROVAL AT THEIR
COST. **#:x*

Approximate Quantities given are estimates only; there are no guaranties to quantities that will be
purchased.



COMPLIANCE WITH THE BEASON-HAMMON ALABAMA TAXPAYER AND CITIZEN PROTECTION ACT
(ACT 2011-535. AS AMENDED BY ACT 2012-491)

By signing this contract, grant, or other agreement, the contracting parties affirm, for the duration of the
agreement, that they will not violate federal immigration law or knowingly employ, hire for employment, or
continue to employ an unauthorized alien within the State of Alabama. Furthermore, a contracting party found
to be in violation of this provision shall be deemed in breach of the agreement and shall be responsible for all
damages resulting therefrom. The Contractor is enrolled in E-Verify unless it is not eligible to enroll because of
the rules of that program or other factors beyond its control.

W-9 TAX DOCUMENTS and E-VERIFY ARE REQUIRED TO BE SUBMITTED WITH THIS BID. FAILURE TO
DO SO WILL RESULT IN REJECTION OF BIDDERS SUBMITTAL




e PRICE QUOTE
North Rlabama Chemical - So.2oniiuoomy i .,

Janitarial Supplies Paper Products Floor Maintenance Equipment SMAIL accountsreceivable@nalce.com
Page 1
Printed 07/29/22 BS
Quoted Ship To
CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL
1910 BEECH AVENUE S.E. 1900 BEECH AVE
Cullman AL 35055 CULLMAN AL 35055

Tel:256-735-2725 Fax:256-735-2451

Quote # Quote Date Exp Date Customer # Customer P/C # Ship Via Writer

|oD13712 07/29/2022112/31/2022|0000471 OUR TRUCK BS

{JobiD Custamer Terms Salesman }

| |Net 30 HA

i Product Dezcription UM !QuantUnit Price| Extension

*********ir************************

| * BID #1406 *

i *i****************************:‘r***

|RJS-SB110015 CHAMPION SUN BRITE BLEACH,6%, Cs 1 20.701 20.70

‘ 5/1 GRL ‘

|RJS-33711 PROGRESSIVE DISINTFECTING CS 1 34 .20 34 .20

| WIPES PLUS,6/75'S PER CASE

LAG-CL0O31650 TOTAL 360 DISINFECTANT CLEANER CS 1 78.60 78.60

i 4/1 GAL PER CS

|BET-31604-00 PH7Q NEUTRAL DISIN. CLEANER, CS i 51.80 51.80

BET-15405-00 AX-IT PLUS FLOOPR STRIPPER,S PL li 72.C0| 72 .00 |
GAL | |

AMC-400420 20" BLUE FLOOR PAD 5/CS cs 1L 15 .75 15: 75

AMC-401220 20" WHITE FLOOR PAD 5/CS CSs il 15 .15 15.75

AMC-404420 20" RED FLOOR PAD 5/CS cs 1 15.75 15.75

AMC-400120 20" BLACK STRIPPING PAD 5/CS CsS 1 15, 75 15.75

BET-50105-00 CTWS501 CAR & TRUCK WASH, 5 PL 1 54 .00 54.00
GAL PAIL

BET-100304-00 SPECTACULOSO MULTI PURPOSE cS s 33.60 33.60
CLEANER, LAVENDER, 4/1 GAL

RJS-KUT5679 SANTI-GEL INSTANT HAND CS 1 62.00 62.00
SANITIZER W/PUMP,4/64 0Z

RJS-5031-420-02 INOPAK STYLE ANTIBACTERIAL CS 6 38.00 38.00
HAND SOAP, 4/1GAL

LAG-DPGC57445CT DAWN POT-N-PAN DISHWASH 4/1GAL CS 1. 71.00 7180

MID-0509-12QT MYSTIC ORANGE CLEANER, 12 CS 1 28.5996 28.60
QT8 /08

MID-0109-12QT CAPRTI ORIGINAL LIQUID CS 1 48.60 48.60
DEODORANT, 12 QTS/CS

S55-48063 GREEN WAVE RTU ORGANIC ACID CS L 43 .80 43.80
RESTROOM CLEANER, 12/CS

PAP-B2720081 #6664 CGLACIER CLEAN FREEZER CS 1 84 .00 84.00
CLEANER, 4/1 GAL.

Continue...



AN ?{ - orh Aatama Chemical

Janitorial Supplies Paper Products Fleor Maintenance Equipment

CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL

1910 BEECH AVENUE S.E.

Cullman AL 35055

Tel:256-735-2725 Fax:256-735-2451

PO. Box 521 » Decaltur. Alabama 35602
PHONE (256) 355-3578 * Fax (256) 355-5264
EMAIL accountsraceivable@nalce.com

Quoted

|

Ship To
CULLMAN COUNTY JATIL
1900 BEECH AVE
CULLMAN AL 35055

PRICE QUOTE

Page 2

Printed 07/29/22 BS

Quote # Quote Date - Exp Date Customier # - Customer PI0 £ - Ship Wiz Writer

QD13712 07/29/2022 12/31/2022.0000471 QUR_TRUCK BS

Job 1D .Bu,bwmrTerms Salzsman

Nt 30 HA

Product Degcription UM [Quant (Unit Price| Ext ension

BET-25804-00C SYMPLICITY GREEN EARTH NO CS 1 78.40 78.40
RINSE FLOOR CLEANER 4GAL/CS

FRE-2WD350-CM WAVE 3.0 URINAL DEOD SCREEN A 1 1.90 1.90
W/ ENZYME, CUCUMBER MEL

CHR-4104 SPRAYPAK SPRAY DISINFECTANT cs | 1 30,80 | 30.50
12/C8

DVO-100975197 GLANCE NON AMMONIATED GLASS CS 1 89.20 89.20
CLEANER,J-FILL,2/CS

LAG-DVS904717 STRIDE FLORAL J-FILL,2/CS s 197.40 187.40

| LAC-DVS5756034 J-512 J-FILL SANTTIZER,2/2.5 &) 1 32.00 32.00]

! T T TaD |
CLEANER J-FILL,2/2.5L/CS i { | '

GC0J-6396-06 G0-J0 SCRUBS IN A BUCKET, Bes 1 7500 75.00]
6/72 PER CASE

IMP-5900 SPRAY PRO TRIGGER SPRAYER, 9 ERA L 0.80 0.80
3/4",WHITE/WHITE

IMP-5032WG 320%Z SPRAY BOTTLE EA 1 0.65 0.65
W/GRADUATIONS

CAB-20002 2-GALLON HANDHELD PUMP UP EA 1 21 ;30 21.30
SPRAYER, POLYETHYLENE

IMP-710 PLASTIC DUST PAN, 12" EA 1 3.85 3.85

ODE-CP-8 UTILITY SCRUB BRUSH, SHORT EA 1 3.30 3.30
HANDLE, CREAM

BBP-280211 ROUND TOILET BOWL BRUSH, EA 1 2,15 2.15
PLASTIC

PAP-F1430179 INSTITUTIONAL WRINGER COMBO EA 1 105.00 105.00
35 QT MOP BUCKET, YELLOW, (NO
WIRE)

BBP-271018 18" SQUEEGEE/BRUSH, W/BLACK EA i 15.80 15.80
FOAM BLADE

ODE-0360 15/16" X 60" WOOD THREAD EA i 375 3.75
HANDLE

MAG-475-DS-LH JUMBO ANGLE BROOM, POLY, BLACK EA 1 5.60 5.560
(USES WOODEN THREAD HANDLE)

Continue...




PRICE QUOTE

N
A P : A 2
L North Hlanamn Ehemn:al g s soumerlfing (00,
; 4443 % Janitorial Supplies Paper Products  Floor Maintenance Equipment EMAIL accountsraceivable@nalcc.com
Page 3
Printed 07/29/22 BS
Quoted Ship To
CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL
1910 BEECH AVENUE S.E. 1900 BEECH AVE
Ccullman AL 35055 CULLMAN AL 35055
Tel:256-735-2725 Fax:256-735-2451
i
Quote # Quote Date Eapﬁae Customer # ECmmmmFm# - Ship Via Writer
QD13712 07/29/2022[12/31/2022|0000471 OUR TRUCK BS
[Jab 1D [ Custamer Terms Salasman
| [N=t 30 ‘ HA
iProduct Description UM Quant‘bnlt Price| Extension
}MAG—BOBZ-NW—BUN ALL CORN WAREHOUSE BROOMS, NO EA 1 9.10 9.10
WIRE, 6 PER BUNDLE
|ODE-5324 2407 . RECULAR COTTON MOP HEADS EA 4 4,10 4,210
| OCDE-C8PW PLASTIC HEAD QUICK CHANZE W/ =R 1 3.30 8.90
POPLAR MQOP HANDLE 54"
555-36¢686 24" X 5" ENDLESS TWIST DUST & 1 84 .60 84 .80
MOP Ra“TLL,ORANGu,lZ/CS
S88-37375 36"X5" DUST MOP FRAME EA 1 3.50 350
585-37378 SWIVEL SNAP DUST MOP HANDLE EA 1. 8.05 8.05|
§85-25587 3" ¥ 5" ENDLESS TWIST DUST CS 1] 117.00 117.30|
¥MOP BEFILL,BLUE,12/C3 ‘ |
SAFETYZONE, VINY EXAM, PF,X-L, CS5 1 34.00 Eé.DCi
100/BX
RJS-GR12ACS GRIDDLE GRILL BRICKS, 12/Cs CS 1 23.7996 23.80
RJS-ISPO1PBACS HOTEL SIZE SOAP PADS, 10 CS 1 38.9004 38.90
PADS/BAG, 12 BGS/CS
585-75118 #9656 SCOURING PAD,GREEN, 6 X 25 1 5.10 6.10
9, 20/CsS
RJS-PPB43450 STAINLESS STEEL SCRUBBING S 1 29,.52 29.52
PADS,12/BX, 6BX/CS
ECO-ESU-5000 ECOSECURITY PAPERBOARD CS 1 310.00 31000
UTENSILS, 5M/CS
RJS-E178020 MED WT WRAPPED SPORKS, cs 1 20.25 20.25
1,000/C8
ELK-F207080 7%8, OT S1IZE, Z2IP-LOCK BAGS, €5 1. 19.90 19.90
500/CS
ELK-F21012G 10X12, GAL SIZE, ZIP-LOCK s i1y 1.9...90 19.90
BAGS, 250/CS
ELK-F20606VP 7IPLOCK SANDWICH BAGS,6 X 6, a5 1 18.25 18.25
1.4 MIL,1,000/CS.
COV-LSR3858XW 38X58 WHITE, 100/CS, .74MIL, €5 1 18.40 18.40
25/RL, 4 RLS/CS.
COV-HR243306N 24X33 CLEAR HI-D, 1000/CS, s il 21.20 21.20
sMIC

Continue...
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Nnrrh Hlahama Enemwal

Janitorial Supplies Paper Products Floor Maintenance Equipment

PO. Box 521 - Decatur. Alabama 35602
BHONE (256) 355-3578 » Fax (256) 355-5264
EMAIL accountsraceivable@nalcc.com

PRICE QUOTE

Page 4
Printed 07/29/22 BS
Quoted Ship To
CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL
1910 BEECH AVENUE S.E. 1900 BEECH AVE
Cullman AL 35055 CULLMAN AL 35055
Tel:256-735-2725 Fax:256-735-2451
Quote # Quote Date Exp Date Customer #  Customer PiC # Ship Via Writer
QD13712 07/29/2022112/31/2022/0000471 OUR TRUCK BS
Job 1D Customer Terms | Salesman
| [ Net 30 | HA
{ Product Description UM iQuant Unit Price| Extension
RJS-0TH10009000 PACTIV 9" NON LAM FOAM DINNER CS 1 36.00 36.00
PLATE, 1-COMP 500/cs !
|RJS-¥YTD19903000 LARGE FOAM HINGED TRAY,3-COMP CS | 32.00 32.00
| 150/CS |
LAG-DCC12J12 12 0Z. STYROFOAM CUPS,1,0006/CS CS 1 £8.00 68.00
LAG-DCClseJ16 16 OZ. STYHO?O;W CUPS,1000/CS8 CS 1 97.25 97,25
RJS-YTH10012000 12 OZ UNLAMINATED STYROFOAM C8 1 54.00 54.00
BONJ#,l,OOO/LS (8 PKS 125/PK)
LAG-16MJ20 16 0Z MED FOAM FOOD CONTAINER CS 1 68.90 68.90
S08/C8 |
LAG-DCCPL200N CLEAR FOR 1.5-2.5 0Z Cs 1 55..00 55.00 |
PORT. CUP,125/PK,20 PKS/CS
RJS-EPL-16-2 EMPRESS H.W. BAGASSEE OVAL Cs 1 114.00 114.00
PLATTER,12.5" X 10",500/CS.
VON-835-N PRESERVE BROWN ROLL TOWELS, €8 1 23.50 23 .50
12/350' PER CS
RJS-585RESOLUTE H.H. ROLL TOWELS, 85/2-PLY Cs il 28.00 28.00
SHEETS, 30/CS.
RJS-248RESOLUTE DELUXE PRO BATHROOM TISSUE, 2 CS 1 34.60 34.60
PLY, 96/CS
LAG-BAGGK6-500 6 LB BROWN GROCERY BAGS, BDL 1 19.95 19: 98
500/BDL, 18406
WPL-182 18" X 2000' FOOD FILM RL 1 22.40 22.40
WPL-297 18" X 500' ELDORADO H.D. RL 1 39.70 39.70
ALUMINUM FOIL
WPL-634 12"X10.75" ALUMINUM FOIL BX 1 21.25 2%25
SHEETS, 500/BOX

Continue...
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PRICE QUOTE

PO Box 521 Decatur, Alabama 35502
PHONE (256) 355-3578 * Fax (256) 355-5264
EMAIL accountsraceivable@nalce.com

Page 5
Printed 07/29/22 BS
Quoted Ship To
CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL
1910 BEECH AVENUE S.E. 1900 BEECH AVE
Cullman AL 35055 CULLMAN AL 35055
Tel :256-735-2725 Fax:256-735-2451
Quote £ Quots Date Exp Date Customer £ t Customer PIC # Ship Yia Writer
op13712 |07/29/2022112/31/2022[0000471 | OUR TRUCK BS
Job 1D Customer Terms | Salesman
N2t 30 '4‘
Product Description GM 'Quant:Unit Price| Extension
|
i
i .
| |
| |
Sub Total 83 ,221.52
Freight $0.00| Total
X: Misc Charges 5$0.00
(Accepted by) Tax Amount $0.00| $3,221.52
MESSAGE TERMS —

Here is your pricing. Let us know if you have any

guestions.

Thank you for the opportunity!




Bid No.1406

INVITATION TO BIDDERS
The Cullman County Commission will be receiving bids until 2:00 p.m., Monday, August 1, 2022, in Room 105 of
the Cullman County Courthouse, Cullman, Alabama, for supplies for the jail. At this time sealed bids will be

publicly opened and read aloud.

Deliveries will be accepted Monday through Friday between 8:00 a.m. and 4:00 p.m. Bidder must be able to
deliver products within fourteen (14) days of order date.

Bid may be awarded whole or in part.

The Cullman County Commission reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to waive any formalities in
the bidding.

If you have any questions regarding this bid, please contact __Susan Black , Cullman County Sheriff’s Office,
directly at 256-775-4714, or email _sblack@cullmansheriff.org .
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SPECIFICATIONS
SUPPLIES FOR CULLMAN COUNTY JAIL

APPROXIMATE Item Descript]on Price per Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, Total
ect.
75 Cases Chlorine Bleach: Clorox, or equivalent, &/ 1 gallon containers ) 5 1.z, .
= = : : P ¥ N pe
percase KK T K BRad b x\ (- 822715 |, 70k. 25
50 Cases Clorox or equivalent wipes, 35 wet wipes per container, 12 N
containers per case 325 | ), %11 .50
30 Cases Fogger Disinfectant for Clorox 360 machine _
CLoROx 2eS0 — 4 x \E 95.b0 [25%6.00
12 containers | 5gal Zguard Professional Antimicrobial Multi-Surface Cleaner OR \ .
x60 - 1gal (handheld foggers) . N 0 BED
5 Containers | Spartan floor wax or equivalent, 5-gal containers ) R
71.20| 39.00
5 Containers | Spartan wax stripper or equivalent, 5-gal containers
5569 31825
5 Boxes Blue SCRUBBING Pad, 20”, box of 5 pads .
e &D| 82.45
5 Boxes White POLISH Pad, 20", box of 5 pads y _ .
LS| BL.25
5 boxes Red BUFFING Pad, 20", box of 5 pads iy .
b4S| 62.25
5 Boxes Black STRIPPING Pad, 20", box of 5 pads ) _
LD 92.29
15 ea. Auto/Car Wash Bucket, 5 gal.
$.90932.50
5 Cases Fabuloso Multipurpose Cleaner, Lavender, 4/1 gal
Q.08 |290.00
5 Cases Hand sanitizer, 4-2L bottles/case
G\ N | 49 ()
Birell Breavs 3\.00|40S.0¢C
75 Cases Anti-bacterial hand soap, 4-one gal. container/per case
% oL c;‘ \ N
RWK - Ay \ G- 1\—1,(,& 5_\40&‘(.
5 Cases Dawn dish soap, case of 4-one gal. bottles
SR EY A G ~/
78.00] 290.00
100 Cases Maxim Mystic Orange, or equivalent Multi-Purpose Degreaser, 1 "
gt bottles, 12/case - “Q %’Tﬁ
100 Cases Capri Original Liquid Deodorant, or equivalent odor eliminator, 1 |
o et NN
qt bottles, 12/case -TrepTea\ M 3490 | 3490, 0C
50 Cases Green Wave Organic Acid Cleaner, or equivalent soap scum/hard
\_. 2.
water / rust cleaner, case of 12-1 gt bottles = \\'QB-D)
2 Cases Freezer Cleaner (FP), 4/1 gal _—
£1.90 |135. 60
20 Cases No-Rinse floor cleaner, 4gal/case (Simplicity)

No®ro




APPROXIMATE Item Description Price per Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, Total
ect.
50 Cases Urine Screen, case of 6-10 screens # | bt
N/ \ N
— \OCasSe 19078T3.00
20 Cases Lysol, or equivalent aerosol disinfectant, case of 12-19 oz. cans o 3 :
= | elare 110 00[2,2.00+00
20 Cases Diversey Glass Non-Ammoniated Glass Clean J-Fill, 2-2.5 L \
bottles - N@bm
20 Cases Diversey Stride DC Floral Concentrate, case of 2-2.5 L bottles
= [Nobm
20 Cases Diversey J-512 Concentrate, Case of 2-2.5 L bottles _ N ) —‘:1_:3
O L b
10 Cases Diversey Triad 111 Concentrate, case of 2-2.5 L bottles
e - | NeBm
5 Cases Scrubs in a Bucket hand cleaner towels, 6-72ct buckets/per case - =
10598 528.9¢
100 ea. 9” Trigger sprayers for 320z. bottle -
1D | 795.00
100 ea. 32 oz. spray bottles 1 ‘ 5 5 ‘ ?j = 20
5ea. 2 gallon pump sprayer _ N \B"ﬂ
20 ea. Dustpan  =—— = =T i - N . . , O
- LD ITAl P\as\cce 450 q0.00
50 ea. Utility Brush with Handle ‘\‘
- 5 \ B:n_
O\ LA
5 ea. Toilet Brush - _
- PIAS\T ¢ T29]21.29
10 ea. Plastic 35 gt. large commercial mop bucket w/ plastic wringer —
NO METAL 9208 [j20.C0
30 ea. Plastic Scrub and Dry Squeegee . ‘;\‘D*?\L
30 ea. Wood Handle, Threaded. Lacquered, 60" long _ o -
44315570
5 Cases Broom Replacement Head, Angled Synthetic Bristle, Case of 12 e
heads - \\}bﬁbi)
50 ea. Upright brooms, black wooden handles, corn bristle, non-angle% N
NO METAL outside nor inside bristles (aANARAL B D 1319 65750
125 Cases Mop heads, cotton 24 oz, 12-240z/case (compatible w/ no metal ) s .
handle) -\ L/C—f-\Sé 5“@'1‘-’ 77__' 5.~G"
25 ea. Mop handles, wooden — NO METAL = :
\b.se | AN2.50
5 Cases 24” Dust mop heads 107520 : "
“\L/AS e ﬁmﬁﬁ\ﬁﬂo&b
10 ea. 36" Dust mop frame, clip on ',., o Ny
F.CO | qC .00
10 ea. Clip-on dust mop handle c‘ GG qu‘ C} O
10 Cases 36" Dust mop heads, 12/case \ZL ) (\ -)JOC ) OO




APPROXIMATE Item Description Price per Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, Total
ect.
3 Cases 21" Hair nets, 1000/case N -
— | No&Sm
150 Cases Vinyl gloves, powder free, 100/box, 10/case
ylg P /box, 10/ _ N: -¢>! :
15 Cases Griddle Grill Bricks, 12/case 4337%0 &56‘ CO
30 Cases Abrasive scouring pads; Brillo or equivalent, 4”x4” steel wool \ P N
pads w/ cleaner Lf'é&} i, t H). CL’
-200-Boxes— Scouring scrub pads (no sponge) 6x9in. 20/box (Triple S)150 ok {2 e
Ll (A, | Cases Suly BuGise of LEPAYSON\Y . 1] 90119900
150-Cases Stainless Ste Scru ads, 6/box, 12 bpxes/case \ ,
100 Box B e Dozen (nlu [1450]124H0.00
10 Cases Eco securrty Paperboard Utensils, 5m/case 1 i\\‘ .
L
10 Cases Plastic wrapped sporks, 1000/case ‘-[ \c_) \ 7 '\,.E] 0
20 Boxes Zip lock quart bags, 500/box ‘ o
1819|200
20 Boxes Zip lock gallon bags, 250/box ;.
32,90 ©50.00
20 Cases Zip lock Sandwich bags #20, 6x6, 1.4 MIL, 1000/case ¥ o
\g S| 363.0¢
300 Cases Garbage bags, heavy duty white, minimum capacity of 55 gal, ) . -
100/case PA\RCK.  Opoly 21750,543- ¢
25 Cases Small garbage bags #33, 1000/case ' .
25. 0| L30.C0
10 Cases 10” Styrofoam plates non-compartment, 5000/case ‘\’ E
_ o XTA
5 Cases Styrofoam 3-Compartment carry out plates ) . .
3120 [ 17L.5¢
30 Cases 120z. Styrofoam drinking cups, 1000/case L ‘ -
5‘\,50 11%445%}
10 Cases 160z. Styrofoam drinking cups, 1000/case N
b ¥t 3
6).39]823.95¢
5 cases 12 oz. Styrofoam Bowls, 8/pks per case, 125/pk . .
11S ®] 629.00
5 Cases 160z. Styrofoam squat containers, 500/case . 1
NS0 | 209 90
5 Cases Lids for 160z. squat containers, 1000/case 5_7 70 \‘{3 % 5 0
5 cases 2 oz, plastic portion clear cup, 2500/case . ) gy
S1.1V] 29%.50
5 cases 2 oz, plastic portion clear cup lids, 2500/case 47 | L;t: Zg 8: O:—}
12 cases Chinet Classic White, 9 3/4x12 1/2 Pltr 9 3/4" x 12 1/2", Oval A e
S L ‘\4 F\ 1}
Platter, 500/cs ZL&Q vl 3, D\L .U (-»J
300 Cases Brown roll paper towels, 12 rolls/case s
2093 [\ 189 &




APPROXIMATE Item Description Price per Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, Total
ect
25 Cases Paper towels, double ply, 30/case B sl 2
% ToP 6l 7.50
600 Cases Toilet paper, double ply, 96/case sl —n
Z719|22740,0¢
5 Bundles 6lb brown bags, 500/bundle ; —
2119|179
20 ea. 18” x 2000’ Food Film oy an
2.0 | 420.(o
20 ea. 18" x 2000" Aluminum Foil ;
i B By
10-bexes 12x10.75 Aluminum Foil Sheets, 500/box - Vi | , p
Jcases < o\d [2[Rox X206 ::\t&JEI/Ose-G w\k\r (2418 298.90
Sub total g -
48,495 9¢

***NOTE: MUST INCLUDE A ‘PRICE QUOTE’ THAT INCLUDES THE PRODUCT DESCRIPTION, PRODUCT NUMBER,
UNIT OF MEASUREMENT (EACH, CASE, ETC.), QUANTITY OF ‘1’, UNIT PRICE, AND EXTENDED PRICE. ALSO
INCLUDE A CATALOG(S) FOR YOUR BUSINESS SO THAT ITEMS CAN BE CONFIRMED.

***NOTE: WE HAVE SEVERAL DIVERSEY BRAND DILUTION DISPENSERS IN THE FACILITY. IF THE VENDOR IS
UNABLE TO PROVIDE THE DIVERSEY BRAND CHEMICALS, THE VENDOR MUST PROVIDE NEW DILUTION
DISPENSERS TO US FOR THE EQUIVALENT CONCENTRATE CHEMICALS THAT ARE LISTED ABOVE AT THE TIME

OF BID APPROVAL AT THEIR COST.****

***NOTE: WOOD HANDLE MUST BE ABLE TO FIT BOTH PLASTIC SCRUB/DRY SQUEEGEE AND BROOM
REPLACEMENT HEADS FOR KITCHEN USE.




The following items must be bid by the referenced brands due to the laundry and dishwasher dispensers that
are currently in use. Cost to the county to change these machines will require that the Commission reject any
bid proposing an alternative where bid specifications indicate a specific brand with no equivalent.

APPROXIMATE Item Description Price per | Extended
QUANTITY gal,case, | Total
ect.
100 Each Spartan Blue-Glo Hand Dishwashing Detergent, 5-gal Ly TP P
O K75 L
20 Each CLF Color Safe Bleach, 15-gal é E;j b k I
» 1 y N
[76-%] 292000
20 Each CLF Liquid Alkali, 15 gal . . _
/73®138L0.0
20 Each CLF Combo Sour/Soft, 15 gal A e
2 24 04 4,920.00
20 Each CLF Laundry Detergent, 15-gal _
277. 2554000
30 Each SparClean All-Temp Dish Machine Dish Detergent, 5-gal 7/ ‘
@ 2130.00
10 Each SparClean All-Temp Dish Machine Rinse Aid, 5-gal _/_) 4) ‘ ‘ 3 C 5
/.99 7\ 9.00
30 Each SparClean Low-Temp Dish Machine Sanitizer, 5-gal 9__7 \ L\-:)\’ o
£S0] LT W
30 Cases Spartan San-T-10 Plus Sanitizer, 2/2.5-gal/ per case .
S eile. Only S.50] 2, 52500
15 Cases Orange Tough 40, 4/1-gal/ per case _ . ~
/2269 \ 33100
GRAND TOTAL 3
1273159
7

***NOTE: MUST INCLUDE A ‘PRICE QUOTE’ THAT INCLUDES THE PRODUCT DESCRIPTION, PRODUCT NUMBER,
UNIT OF MEASUREMENT (EACH, CASE, ETC.), QUANTITY OF ‘1’, UNIT PRICE, AND EXTENDED PRICE. ALSO
INCLUDE A CATALOG(S) FOR YOUR BUSINESS SO THAT ITEMS CAN BE CONFIRMED.

***NOTE: WE HAVE LAUNDRY DILUTION DISPENSERS IN THE FACILITY. IF THE VENDOR IS UNABLE TO
PROVIDE THE LISTED CHEMICALS, THE VENDOR MUST PROVIDE NEW DILUTION DISPENSERS TO US FOR THE
EQUIVALENT CONCENTRATE CHEMICALS THAT ARE LISTED ABOVE AT THE TIME OF BID APPROVAL AT THEIR

COST.****

Approximate Quantities given are estimates only; there are no guaranties to quantities that will be

purchased.




COMPLIANCE WITH THE BEASON-HAMMON ALABAMA TAXPAYER AND CITIZEN PROTECTION ACT
(ACT 2011-535. AS AMENDED BY ACT 2012-491)

By signing this contract, grant, or other agreement, the contracting parties affirm, for the duration of the
agreement, that they will not violate federal immigration law or knowingly employ, hire for employment, or
continue to employ an unauthorized alien within the State of Alabama. Furthermore, a contracting party found
to be in violation of this provision shall be deemed in breach of the agreement and shall be responsible for all
damages resulting therefrom. The Contractor is enrolled in E-Verify unless it is not eligible to enroll because of

the rules of that program or other factors beyond its control.

W-9 TAX DOCUMENTS and E-VERIFY ARE REQUIRED TO BE SUBMITTED WITH THIS BID. FAILURE TO
DO SO WILL RESULT IN REJECTION OF BIDDERS SUBMITTAL



PRICE QUOTE
CENTRAL PAPER COMPANY, INC

oo rrpeai Remit Payment To Phone 205-942-6333
P 0 BOX 12807 Fax 209-941-2070
Focusad on YOU BIRMINGHAM, AL 35202-2807
Page 1
Printed 07/21/22 PN
Quoted Ship To
CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS
Attn: KIM TUGGLE Attn: KIM TUGGLE
1900 BEECH AVE SE SHERIFF'S OFFICE
CULLMAN AL 35055 1900 BEECH AVE SE
Tel:256-775-4714 Fax:256-735-2456 CULLMAN AL 35055
Quote # Quote Date Exp Date Customer # Customer P[0 # Ship Via Writer
0016582 |07/21/2022[08/20/2022)|0161880 QUR TRUCK EP
Job ID Customer Terms Salesman
NET 30 LARRY NORRIS
Broduet | Dascriptien UM Quant[Unit Price| Extension
725739 $%*BLEACH 6/1-GALLON GERMICIDAL CA 1 22.77T5 22.7158
11008635042/SB110016
811190 01593/01594 CLOROX WIPES Ca 1 36 25 36..2.5
12/35ct DISINFECTING
811705 31650 TOTAL 360 DISINFECTANT CA 1 85.60 85.60
CLEANER 4/1GAL
SP Zguard - NO BID EA 1 0.00 0.00
8261116 407305 ON AN' ON 5GAL FLOOR BT 1 77.20 77.20
FINISH
826171 008405 EMULSIFIER PLUS 5 GAL PL 1 63.65 6£3.65
STRIPPER
705206 53-20 BLUE 20" CLEANER PAD CA 1 16.45 16.45
5/C8
705203 41-20 WHITE 20" FLOOR PAD, CA L 16.45 16.45
POLISHING 5/CS
705207 51-20 RED 20" FLOOR PAD, CA 1 16.45 16.45
SCRUBBING/BUFFING 5/CS
705204 72-20 BLACK 20" FLOOR PAD, CA 1 16.45 16.45
STRIPPING 5/CS, #72
826557 3002 XTREME CUSTCM CAR WASH PL 1L 55 . 50 55.50
5-GAL
1255253 05253 Fabuloso Prof Cleaner CA 1 50.00 50.00
All-Purpose Lavender Scent
4/1Gal
8142685 9625-04 PURELL ADVANCED HAND CA 1 81.00 81.00
SANITIZER GEL, 2-LITER PUMP
BOTTLE 4/CS
SP BWK Anti Bac Scap 4x1lg EA 1 42.00 42.00
725694 57445 DAWN 4/1GAL MANUAL POT CA 1 7800 78.00
& PAN DISH DETERGENT BLUE
ORIGINAL
iy Mystic Orange - NO BID EA 1 0.00 .00
8060040 1090012 TROPICAL MIST ODOR CA 1 34.56 34.50
COUNTERACTANT 12/QTS
SE Green Wave - NO BID EA 1 0.00 0.00

Continue. ..




“Fagar Company Inc.

Focused on YOU

CULLMAN CO DEP OF
KIM TUGGLE
1900 BEECH AVE SE
CULLMAN AL 35055

Attn:

CENTRAL PAPER COMPANY, INC

Remit Payment To
P 0 BOX 12807
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35202-2807

Quoted
CORRECTIONS

PRICE QUOTE

Ship To

KIM TUGGLE

Phone 205-942-6333
Fax 205-941-2070

Page 2

Printed 07/21/22 PN

CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS
Attn:
SHERIFF'S OFFICE
1900 BEECH AVE SE

Tel:256-775-4714 Fax:256-735-2456 CULLMAN AL 35055
Tuoe# | |GwowDate  |ExpDaw | Customer# | Customer PIO 7 Sve Wi |
0016582 |07/21/2022{08/20/2022]0161880 QUR TRUCK EP
Job 1D Customer Terms Salesman
NET 30 LARRY NORRIS
Product _ Description Lo : UM [Quant |Unit Price| Extension
8260375 3128 FREEZER CLEANER FP HEAVY CA 1 67.80 67.80
DUTY 4/1GAL
SP No Rinse - NO BID EA 1 0.00 0.00
443028 AWUSQ0Q7 MANGO URINAL SCREEN CT 1 17.50 17.50
CLEAN CHECK 10/CTN
T25663 74828/79329 LYSOL CRISP LINEN CA iE 110.00 110.00
190zDISINFECTANT AERCSOL SPRAY
12 /CASE
SP Diversey Glass - NO BID E 1 0.00 0.00
SP Diversey Stride - NO BID EA i 0.00 0.00
SE Diversey J-512 - NC BID EA il 0.00 0.00
SP Diversey Triad - NC BID EA 1 0.00 0.0C
SE Scrubs 1in Bucket 6x72 EA i 1:95 , 90 105.90
683094 4745 TRIGGER SPRAYER WHITE EA 1 0.75 0.75
9/10"
683101 5032WG PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE EA 1 1.35 1,35
320z w/ GRADUATIONS, EMPTY
SP 2G Sprayer - NO BID E 1 0.00 0.00C
393043 393043 INDUSTRIAL DUST PAN EA 1 4..50 4.50
PLASTIC
SP Utility Brush - NO BID EA 1 0.00 0.00
RUB6310 6310 WHITE BOWL BRUSH 14-1/2" EA L 4,25 4.25
PLASTIC HANDLE POLYPRO FILL
RUB75904 759088 YELLOW MOP COMBO EA 1 92.00 92.00
WAVEBREAK INSTITUTIONAL
SP Sgueegee - NO BID E 1 000 0.00
RUB6361 361 60" THREADED WOOD HANDLE EA 1 4.43 4.43
LACQUERED, 1.3" DIAMETER
SE Broom - NO BID EA 1 0.00 0.00
393069 A205013W-JB JAIL BROOM 30LB EA 1 13.15 15;1:8
56" NATURAL WOOD HANDLE-NO
METAL CORN/FIBER
SP 24 Mop Head - 12/case EA 1 58.20 58.20
393016 393016 60" MOP HANDLE QUICK EA 1 16.50 16.50
BITE FIBERGLASS w/ BLK PLASTIC

Continue. ..




PRICE QUOTE
CENTRAL PAPER COMPANY, INC

Remit Payment To Phone 205-942-6333
P 0 BOX 12807 Fax 205-341.2070
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35202-2807

Page 3

Printed 07/21/22 PN

Quoted Ship To
CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS
Attn: KIM TUGGLE Attn: KIM TUGGLE
1900 BEECH AVE SE SHERIFF'S OFFICE
CULLMAN AL 35055 1900 BEECH AVE SE
Tel:256-775-4714 Fax:256-735-2456 CULLMAN AL 35055
Quote # ~ | Quots Date CtExpDate {Customer# | CustomerP/I0 £ e RShIp I T T L R
Q016582 07/21/2022 08/20/2022 0161880 QUR TRLCK EP
Job ID Customer Terms Salesman
NET 30 LARRY NORRIS
Product = = Description e " UM |Quant |[Unit Price| Extension
HEAD
SP 24" Dust mop - 12/cs EA 1 103,20 1.03.-20
691285 DUSTMOP FRAME 36" SWIVEL SNAP EA 1 9.00 8..00
5I!X3f|1
393447 393447 CLIP-ON DUST MOP HANDLE EA 1 9.00 9.00
60" WOOD (12640)
SP 36" Dust mop -12/cs E 1 126.00 126.00
SP 21" Hair Net - NO BID EA i 0.00 0.00
SP Vinyl Glove - NO BID B 1 0.00 0.00
464450 GRILL BRICKS 12/PK RGB49 CA 1 37.40 37.40
725630 W240000 STEEL WOOQOL SOAP PAD CA il 48.00 48.00
BRILLO HOTEL SIZE 12BX/1l0ea
4" x4™ 120ER/CS
705730 S096 6x9 GREEN SCOUR PAD CA 1 14 .50 17.50
MEDIUM DUTY (#96) 6/10CT
464410 S775 STAINLESS STEEL SPONGE DZ i 14.90 14.90
DOZEN PACK
SP Eco Security - NO BID EA 1 0.00 0.00
5040105 175PP2 SPORK WRAPPED WHITE CA 1 17.15 1.7 . 16
MEDIUM WEIGHT, 1000/CS
8320061 6a2255 ZIPLDC 19T BI2E "3 CA 1 18.15 18.15
SANDWICH BAG 500/bx 6-1/2X56
1.2ML
8320065 682257 ZIPLOC BAG 1GAL 250/CS CA 1 32.50 32.50
10.5x11, WRITE-ON PANEL
Low SEMIL
8320061 682255 ZIPLOC 1QT SIZE "8" CA 1 18.45 18.45
SANDWICH BAG 500/bx 6-1/2X6
1.2ML
668107 EC385812K 38¥X58 LINER 1.ZMIL CA 1 27.75 27.75
BLACK LLDPE 10/ROLL 10RL/CS
BT S243306N LINER 24x33 6MIC CA 1 25.20 2520
CLEAR/NATURAL 12-16GAL 50/ROLL
20-ROLLS/CASE HDPE INTERLEAVED
SP 10" Foam - NO BID EA 1 0.00 0.00

Continue. ..



PRICE QUOTE
CENTRAL PAPER COMPANY, INC

ER— Remit Payment To Phone 205-942-6333
P 0 BOX 12807 Fax 205-941-2070
5 { on YOU BIRMINGHAM, AL 35202-2807
Page 4
Printed 07/21/22 PN
Quoted Ship To —
CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS
Attn: KIM TUGGLE Attn: KIM TUGGLE
1900 BEECH AVE SE SHERIFF'S OFFICE
CULLMAN AL 35055 1900 BEECH AVE SE
Tel:256-775-4714 Fax:256-735-2456 CULLMAN AL 35055
Quote# | Ouote Date Expbate . |Customer# | CustomerPIO# 0o pShipVia oo o .
0016582 |07/21/2022]108/20/2022]0161880 OUR TRUCK
Job ID Customer Terms Salesman
NET 30 LARRY NORRIS
Broduct | Descriptiesm UM [Ouant|Unit Price| Extension
170424 RE993/9x9 DIVISION WHITE LARGE CA 1 39.30 39,30
HINGE 3-COMP CONTAINER 9"x9"
200/cs 140D
170012 12B12 CUP FOAM 120z 1000/cs CA 1 51 5 50 51.50
TALL
17200289 16J16 FOAM CUP l6oz WHITE CA 1 82.35 B82.35
40/25CT 1000/CS
1720165 12B32 FOAM BCWL 12 0Z 20/50 CA 1 125.00 125.00
170215 16FC20 1602z FOAM FOOD CA 1 41 .90 41 .90
CONTAINER WHITE
500/CS 20pks/25ea
170153 LVFC20 LID TRANSLUCENT VENTED CA 1 37.70 37T 70
1000/cs FOR 8-12-1602z2
CONTAINERS
NET151320 151320/PC200 20z PORTION CUP CA 1 59.70 59. 70
PLASTIC 2500/CS LID#NET151331
NET151331 01361 LID CLEAR PLASTIC CA 1 47.60 47.60
XL250PC/PL200ON FITS 1.5-20z
PORTION CUP 20/125CT 2500/CS
HUH21257 21257 CHINET PLATTER 9.75X12.5 CA 1 260.00 260.00
500(4/125) OVAL CLASSIC PAPER
DINNERWARE WHITE
3354050 RK350A HARDWOUND ROLL TOWEL CA 1 20.95 20 .95
NATURAL 8", 350FT UNIVERSAL
PACK SIZE: 12ROLLS/CASE
3354590 HB1990A KITCHEN ROLL TOWEL CA 1 24.70 24.70
WHITE 2PLY PERFORATED 30/84
PACK SIZE: 30/CASE
3352000 TM1616S BATH TISSUE 2-PLY WHT CA ik 37.15 37515
500SHEETS/ROLL 96/cs 4"x3.75"
0370086 64 BROWN PAPER BAG 500/BDL BL 1 21 . 15 21..15
6x3.6x11.1 GBOGNPSC
091202 AW182/182Z CLING FILM RL 1 21.:90 21.00
18"x2000"'SLIDE-ZIP CUTTERBOX
7318518

Continue. ..



CENTRAL PAPER COMPANY,

INC

PRICE QUOTE

G Remit Payment To Phone 205-942-6333
P 0 BOX 12807 Fax 205-941-2070
Focused on YOU BIRMINGHAM, AL 35202-2807
Page 5
Printed 07/21/22 PN
Quoted Ship To ==
CULLMAN CC DEP OF CORRECTIONS CULLMAN CO DEP OF CORRECTIONS
Attn: KIM TUGGLE Attn: KIM TUGGLE
1900 BEECH AVE SE SHERIFF'S QFFICE
CULLMAN AL 35055 1900 BEECH AVE SE
Tel:256-775-4714 Fax:256-735-2456 CULLMAN AL 35055
Quote d - o iPxpDate 0 | Customer# CustomerPIO# - 'ShipVia S Writer
0016582 07/21/2022 08/20/2022 0161880 OUR TRUC EP
Job 1D Customer Terms Salesman
NET 30 LARRY NORRIS
Product -Description o UM *Quaﬂt‘ﬂhit"ﬁriée1 Ekﬁen$ioh
P 18 Foil - NO BID EA il 0.00 0.00
302086 21215 FOIL SHEETS 12x10.75 CA 1 124 .25 124.25
SILVER, POP-UP 12BX/200SHT
82603522 311105 BLUE GLO 5 GAL PL 1 €5.75 £5.75
826722 700515 CLF COLOR SAFE BLEACH DR 1 146.00 146.00
15 GALLON
826777 701615 CLF LIQUID ALXALI 15 DR 1 193.C0 193.00
GAL
826742 700915 CLF SOUR/SOFTENER 15 DR 1 226.00 226:00
GAL
826712 700315 CLF LAUNDRY DETERGENT DR 1 272.00 272.00
15 GAL
8260528 764905 SPARCLEAN DETERGENT II PL 1. 71.00 71.00
49 ALL TEMP, 5GAL PAIL
826916 166105 SPARCLEAN #61 5gal PL it 71.50 71.50
RINSE AID II
826926 765405 SPARCLEAN SANITIZER LOW PL 1 47.50 47.50
TEMP #54, 5-GAL PAIL
8260406 3159 SANI-T-10 PLUS 5-GALLON PL 1 86.50 86.50
B26471 224004 ORANGE TOUGH 40 4/1GAL CA 1 122.60 122.60
Sub Total $3,988.88
Freight $0.0 T ot al
X: Misc Charges $0.00
(Accepted by) Tax Amount $0.00| $3,988.88

MESSAGE

TERMS

THANK YOU FOR THE OPPORTUNITY TO BE OF SERVICE

CHEMICAL EMERGENCY 1-800-5635-5053
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DISTRIBUTION BY DESIGN

‘Paper Company Inc.

Focused on YOU

7-12-2022
To: Cullman County Commission
Re: Catalogue of Products

Central Paper Company does not print paper catalogues. Our On-Line Catalogue can be found by clicking on
the ‘Shop Now’ button on our website at:

http://ecommerce.centralpaper-al.com/

Thank You

Erick Petterson

Vice President of Contract & Government Programs
Central Paper Company
epetterson@centralpaper-al.com

(205) 243-7258 Cell

140 W. Oxmoor Rd 1201 Newell Parkway ‘ 154 lvey Street
Birmingham, AL 35209 Montgomery, AL 36110 Monroeville, AL 36460
1.800.854.0619 1.800.526.1436 1.800.451.4419
205.941.2070 Fax 334.244.1198 Fax 251.575.2403 Fax

P.O. Box 12807, Birmingham, AL 35202-2807 | www.centralpaper-al.com
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COMMISSION

Members of the Cullman
County Commission
Chairman Jeff Clemons

RE:  Opinion on Applicability of Executive Session

Dear Commissioners and Chairman:
I am writing to advise the Members of the Cullman County Commission as follows:

That I have reviewed the matter on which the Commission is considering convening an
executive session for discussion on the general reputation, character, physical condition, mental
health, professional competence of an individual, or job performance of a public employee which
is not required by Alabama law to file a Statement of Economic Interest, and have determined
that, in my legal opinion, this matter is appropriate for executive session under Section 7 of Act
No. 2005-40

That I have reviewed the matter on which the Commission is considering convening an executive
session for discussion of the discipline or dismissal of, or to hear formal written complaints or
charges brought against a public employee or an individual, corporation, partnerships, or legal
entity subject to the regulation of the governmental body and have determined that, in my legal
opinion, this matter is appropriate for executive session under Section 7 of Act No. 2005-40.

&7 That I have reviewed the matter on which the Commission is considering convening an executive
session for discussion with legal counsel regarding a legal matter or to meet or confer with a
mediator or arbitrator, and have determined that, in my legal opinion, this matter is appropriate
for executive session under Section 7 Act No. 2005-40.

That I have reviewed the matter on which the Commission is considering convening an executive
session for discussion of security matters and have determined that, in my legal opinion, this
matter is appropriate for executive session under Section 7 of Act No. 2005-40.

That I have reviewed the matter on which the Commission is considering convening an executive
session to discuss matters related to a criminal investigation and/or matters which may reveal the
identity of an undercover law enforcement agent or informer. It is my opinion, and [ am advising
the Commission that this discussion would imperil effective law enforcement if conducted
outside of executive session, and that under authority granted under Section 7 of Act No. 2005-
40, this body may convene an executive session for this discussion.

500 Second Avenue, S.W., Room 105 Cullman, Alabama 35055 Phone (256) 775-4878 Fax (256) 739-3525
www.co.cullman.al.us e-mail: ccc@co.cullman.al.us
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COMMISSION

That I have reviewed the matter on which the Commission is considering convening an executive
session to discuss matters related to the discussion of the price to offer or accept for the purchase,
sale, exchange, lease, of and/or the market value of real property and have determined that, in my
legal opinion, this matter is appropriate for executive session under Section 7 of Act No. 2005-40.

That I have reviewed the commerce or trade matter which the Commission proposes to discuss in
executive session. It is my opinion that an executive session is authorized for this discussion
under Section 7 (a)(7) of Act No. 2005-40, and that it will have a detrimental effect upon the
competitive position of the Cullman County Commission of Cullman County or will reveal
information protected by the Alabama Trade Secrets Act if the discussion is conducted outside of
executive session.

That the County Commission may properly convene an executive session for the discussion of
pending negotiations with a group of County employees under Section 7(a)(8) of Act No. 2005-
40, and that there would be a detrimental effect upon the negotiating position of Cullman County
if discussions of this matter were conducted outside of an executive session.

That I have reviewed the matter on which the Commission is considering convening an executive
session and that the governmental body is acting as a “quasi-judicial body” and may enter into
executive session to deliberate and discuss evidence or testimony presented during a public or
contested case hearing.

Pursuant to Section 7 of Act No. 2005-40, a copy of this letter should be attached to the minutes of the
County Commission meeting wherein the body considers a motion to convene an executive session to
discuss this matter.

Sincerely,

Emlly Nieze hnston
Attorney for Cullman County

500 Second Avenue, S.W., Room 105 Cullman, Alabama 35055 Phone (256) 775-4878 Fax (256) 739-3525
www.co.cullman.al.us e-mail: ccc@co.cullman.al.us



